
ID: 2753  

LOCATION

City:
District:
Street:

Warszawa
Mokotów
Orkana

DESCRIPTION

For rent an elegant apartment situated in the
prestigious, quiet and safe area of the Upper
Mokotov. Excellent location. Area 133.5 sq m,
apartment is located on the first floor of the
building, where in each floor there is just one
apartment, and the entire building has only 3
apartments, which gives a sense of intimate.
Windows in the apartment are the anti-burglar
and soundproofed, which means that the
apartment is very quiet. The apartment is
partially furnished in modern style, but there is a
possibility to fully furnish. Kitchen with island,
fully furnished and equipped with all necessary
equipment. Furnished living room and dining
room with a terrace. The living room has a
fireplace. Several large and comfortable built-in
wardrobes. The apartment has 3 bedrooms. In
the apartment there is a guest WC near the living
room, two bathrooms next to bedrooms and a
laundry room. The floors in the bathrooms and
the hall are heated. Parking space in the garage
outside standing on the property. It is also a large
terrace with an area of 14.6 sq m.

ADDITIONAL INFORMATION

area:
rooms:
floor:

133m2
4
1st

CONTACT PRICE

phone: +48502232259
property@dr-house.com.pl 7500 PLN
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